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Further to your information request FOI/EIR 23/24-067, please find your question and our response 
below. 
 

Request:  
i. Whether the authority had personnel stationed either outside or inside polling stations on 4th May 

2023 for the purpose of reminding potential voters that they need to have valid photo ID 
ii. Whether any potential voters who decided not to continue to enter the polling station as a result of 

this interaction were counted towards the total number of voters refused a ballot/turned away due 
to the new Voter ID regulations 

iii. Whether this figure will be published? 
 

Response:  
i. 7 polling stations had additional staff, inside the polling stations, to greet voters for the purpose of 

reminding them about the new voter ID requirements. 
ii. Any voters who may have decided not to continue into the polling station was not recorded. 
iii. Please see above, this information was not recorded.  

 
This concludes your request FOI/EIR 23/24-067 
 
If information has been refused please treat this as a Refusal Notice for the purposes of the Act.  
 
If you disagree with our decision or are otherwise unhappy with how we have dealt with your request in 
the first instance you may approach foi@eastcambs.gov.uk and request a review. A request for review 
must be made in no more than 40 working days from the date of this email. 
 
Should you remain dissatisfied with the outcome you have a right under s50 of the Freedom of 
Information Act to appeal against the decision by contacting the Information Commissioner, Wycliffe 
House, Water Lane, Wilmslow SK9 5AF. 


