



EAST CAMBRIDGESHIRE DISTRICT COUNCIL

THE GRANGE, NUTHOLT LANE,
ELY, CAMBRIDGESHIRE CB7 4EE

Telephone: Ely (01353) 665555

DX41001 ELY Fax: (01353) 665240

www.eastcambs.gov.uk

Further to your information request FOI/EIR 22/23-130 please find your question and our response below.

Request:

- A copy of any project plans associated with the implementation of Microsoft OneDrive in your organisation
- A copy of any project plans associated with the implementation of Microsoft Sharepoint in your organization
- A copy of any audit reports (to determine the effectiveness of your IT Service Desk or IT Helpdesk) undertaken on your IT Service Desk or IT Helpdesk between 2018 and the present day.

Response:

- Information Not Held
- Information Not Held
- Information Refused under Section 33

In relation to your request for a copy of any Audit Reports - this information is exempt from disclosure under Section 33 of the Freedom of Information Act 2000. In respect of those requests that are answered in full, partially or the total refused, please take this as notice under FOIA, that we:

- a) Consider the information as exempt from disclosure under the Act;
- b) Claim exempt under sections of the Act:

Section 33 – Public Audit Functions

- c) State why the exemption applies:

33.-(1) This section applies to any public authority which has functions in relation to - (a) the audit of the accounts of other public authorities, or (b) the examination of the economy, efficiency and effectiveness with which other public authorities use their resources in discharging their functions. (2) Information held by a public authority to which this section applies is exempt information if its disclosure would, or would be likely to, prejudice the exercise of any of the authority's functions in relation to any of the matters referred to in subsection (1). (3) The duty to confirm or deny does not arise in relation to a public authority to which this section applies if, or to the extent that, compliance with section 1(1)(a) would, or would be likely to, prejudice the exercise of any of the authority's functions in relation to any of the matters referred to in subsection (1).

This concludes your request FOI/EIR 22/23-130

If information has been refused please treat this as a Refusal Notice for the purposes of the Act.

If you disagree with our decision or are otherwise unhappy with how we have dealt with your request in the first instance you may approach foi@eastcambs.gov.uk and request a review. A request for review must be made in no more than 40 working days from the date of this email.

Should you remain dissatisfied with the outcome you have a right under s50 of the Freedom of Information Act to appeal against the decision by contacting the Information Commissioner, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow SK9 5AF.

