



EAST CAMBRIDGESHIRE DISTRICT COUNCIL

THE GRANGE, NUTHOLT LANE,
ELY, CAMBRIDGESHIRE CB7 4EE

Telephone: Ely (01353) 665555
DX41001 ELY Fax: (01353) 665240
www.eastcambs.gov.uk

Further to your information request FOI/EIR 21/22-243 please find your question and our response below.

Request:

1. Who owns Pretoria Energy?
2. Have the Produce Connection Potato Company put their reject potatoes in for energy?
3. There seems to be greenhouses in front of silos – just noticed them. What are they for?
4. Is any maize stored in clamps on site or nearby sites?
5. Tons of maize and grass used in a day, wheat etc. acres grown of maize etc.
6. Web sites etc.
7. Who owns the new site at Manea?

Response:

There are two planning applications associated with Pretoria Energy:

12/00055/FUL - Proposed farm anaerobic digester plant (Not submitted by Pretoria Energy, the applicant is the Produce Connection, but same site)

16/00410/FUL - Extension to existing anaerobic digester plant with erection of 3 no new storage tanks

1. Information Not Held. Planning relates to the land, the applicant says they own the land, but we don't know who owns the business.
2. Information Not Held. Please note: The Committee Report (attached) refers to maize not potatoes. Report for 2012 permission also just references maize and grass (attached).
3. Information Not Held
4. Please see attached Committee Report which discusses maize.
5. We are unsure what is being asked here
6. We are unsure what is being asked here
7. Information Not Held

This concludes your request FOI/EIR 21/22-243

If information has been refused please treat this as a Refusal Notice for the purposes of the Act.

If you disagree with our decision or are otherwise unhappy with how we have dealt with your request in the first instance you may approach foi@eastcambs.gov.uk and request a review. A request for review must be made in no more than 40 working days from the date of this email.

Should you remain dissatisfied with the outcome you have a right under s50 of the Freedom of Information Act to appeal against the decision by contacting the Information Commissioner, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow SK9 5AF.